
Cancellation Quote

Only Active contracts can 
be cancelled.

After choosing an active 
contract from the 
contract screen click 
‘Cancellation Quote’ to 
calculate the cancellation 
amount.

A Active: Submitted, Remitted AND Paid
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Cancellation Quote

• Under Cancellation 
Information you will 
need to enter:

•Cancel Date
•Cancel Odometer
•Cancel Reason

• Click ‘Calculate’ to 
calculate and view 
cancellation rates.

• Make sure to click 
‘recalculate’ to ensure 
accurate quote is 
given.
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Cancellation Quote

Once the calculation has 
been made click ‘Save 
Quote’.
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Cancellation Quote

After you click ‘Save 
Quote’ a cancellation 
quote worksheet will be 
created.

Click ‘Print’ to print the 
cancellation quote 
worksheet.

Printed cancellation 
quote worksheet and 
supporting 
documentation should be 
submitted to PWC via fax 
360-848-7923 Attn: 
Cancellations
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